
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

DATES TO REMEMBER 

2024 

Mon 10th June Monarch’s Birthday – Public 
Holiday 

Tues 11th June BSEM Professional Learning – 
Curriculum Day (Pupil Free) 

Wed 12th June Thank a First Responder 
Afternoon Tea 

2.30 pm – 3.30 pm 

Wed 19th June School Photos 

Mon 24th June Reports go home 

Wed 26th June 3 Way Conferences 

2.30 pm start 

Fri 28th June Last day of term – 2.30 pm 
dismissal 

Mon 15th July First day of term 3 

 
 
AWARDS 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

CURRICULUM DAY – TUESDAY 11TH JUNE 

Don’t forget that Tuesday 11th June the school 
has a curriculum day and therefore it will be a 
pupil free day. The whole staff will be attending 
our final Berry Street Education Model 
professional learning day at Olinda Primary 
School. 

 

WALK/RIDE TO SCHOOL DAY 
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Thank you to everyone who participated in the 
walk/ride to school day last Monday 3rd June. 
Fifteen of seventeen students lightened their 
carbon footprint for the better. Special call out 
to Amy and Joel riding all the way to Silvan 
from Mt Evelyn, Mrs. Hughes, and Mrs. 
Wallace for shuttling up and back to Queens 
Rd on foot, keeping our students safe. Mrs 
Tirchett meeting us there, on her motorbike, 
strapping school bags to her bike and Casey 
supervising the ride back to school on his push 
bike. 

 

FIRST RESPONDERS THANK YOU 

AFTERNOON TEA 

Don’t forget the ‘First Responder Thank You 
Afternoon Tea, on Wednesday 12th June. Our 
school will be recognizing and appreciating the 
first responders in our community by hosting a 
‘Thank You Afternoon Tea’. It will be at Silvan 
Primary from 2.30 pm – 3.30 pm. Everyone is 
welcome to attend and join us in thanking our 
first responders. 
 
 

 

COOKING 

Spaghetti meatballs were on offer during 
cooking class today. There were no leftovers, 
Dane. Fettuccine carbonara is likely next 
Friday. 

 
 

 
 
 
 



  


